
FUN Fast Fact Math Practice 

Give choice and make math fun, and your child will want to practice! 
The QR Codes are videos showing how to play each game. 

Flash Card Practice 

 
Pull out 5-10 flashcards and study those for 
several days in a row.  Once you can solve the 
fact quickly, add the flashcard to a “I know” 
pile. 

Slap-it     

             
  

Lay 5 cards on the table.  Ask your child to 
slap the card that equals _________.  Your 
child can use a spatula, fly swatter, or even 
their hand.  For extra practice, have your 
child call out the numbers for you to slap.  
 

Find it on the Floor 

 
The adult takes regular sized paper and 
writes 1 answer on each paper from the 
flashcards the child is studying.  Lay the 
papers around the room.  The child takes 
flashcards, solves one and places the 
flashcard on the paper with the correct 
answer.  The adult checks the answers.  

Go Fish (2-4 players) 

              
Each player gets 7 cards in their hand.  They 
ask the other player for a card with their 
answer and work to make pairs with the 
cards.  They draw a card if the other player 
doesn’t have that card.  The player with the 
most pairs wins in the end.  

 

Fast Fact War   
2 players each put a card down to face off.  
The player with the highest answer keeps 
both cards.  If the answer is the same, both 
players put down two more cards and the 
player with the highest answer on those 
cards keeps all 4 cards.  The player with the 
most cards when the pile runs out wins.  

Fact Family 
(Grades 2-5) 

   
Slide the fact family practice into a sheet 
protector.  Use your fact family knowledge to 
fill in the missing numbers. 

 

https://youtu.be/ERWsLzb69HQ
https://youtu.be/Bo7h_PiqpgM
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=3BJfNqr4Ewo
https://youtu.be/EFGE8oAHQY0
https://youtu.be/h5QMc0F56vQ
https://youtu.be/8Tlq8rdyKig
https://thetruthfultutor.com/product/simple-math-flashcards/
https://creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nc/3.0/
http://www.heckofabunch.com/2019/11/go-fish-dvd-review.html
https://creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nc-nd/3.0/

